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Service License

License Number

Registration
Number

Licensee Name

Operating Name

Nationality
License Address

Manager
Issue Date
Expiry Date
Activities

Remarks

Customer No.
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JLT-66492
JLT2341

SALON EDUCATORS JLT

SALON EDUCATORS JLT

United Arab Emirates

Unit No: 1904

Tiffany Towers

Plot No: JLT-PH2-W2A
Jumeirah Lakes Towers
Dubal

UAE

Deborah Whitehead
23-Nov-2011
22-Nov-2015

Beauty Salon Training
Center
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Professional License

License Detalls / duasyl Jusolas

License No, 740081 dasyll g3,
Osllo (seu pusl> M |

Trade Name GLOSS BEAUTY SALON

Legal Type €ivil Company i aa Jlacl welall Jsdll

Explry Date 09/08/2017 el o |ssue Date 10/08/2015 slaadl 7yG

DA&B D-U-N-5 * No, = Main License No. 740081 pdl duad )l pdy

wrallall @il
Reglster No. DCCI No. dd il dygude

Sslaill Yol o3,

License Members / dwaiyll L3kl

Share / yauaxll Role /da.all Nationality / dcuuiall Name / pail
25.00% Partner / cly United Kingdom / Lilla 588302 ANDREW ROBERT MCKEOWN / (j9a8e Cisusy o233l
25.00% Partner / ulyd United Kingdom / Lilky 548659 DEBORAH WHITEHEAD / 1.0l olygass
25.00% Partner [/ vLiys Bahrain / el 588303 sara ahmed jasim ahmed jamal / puols Aa=l 55l

Jl.u'- sasi

25.00% Partner [ vl United Kingdom / Lol 548695 MARK RODNEY BUTCHER / gy uble
Manager / y3a United Kingdom / Lol s 548659 DEBORAH WHITEHEAD / a.a5lg slyga

Agent / olsss LSy United Arab Emirates / 287836 JASSIM MOHD HASSAN ALSHAIKH GHULAM

Olladl ABBAS ALANSARI f ‘aﬂ.& éa_.&]l s Aaswa P.n.lbt
olaill pale
:‘ _ License Activities / djtadll diady)l bl

Technical and Occupatlonal Skills Training dpazll dggall Oljlgall e vy

Women Salon ol gpll

Ladies Cosmetic & Personal Care Center (t;:!l""‘j) dpiaints dlicg Jyas 38,

Address [ olsi=

Telephone 0971-04-3216588 aduls P.O. Box 391056 sasdll Beak

Fax 971-04-3216570 wuslé Parcel ID 357227 dabill o

Maoblle No 971-50-4522736 wWysaall waslgll LWl lauall - WOYER St eyl d PEJ"'
rint Date 02/05/2017 1118 delbll 7,6 Receipt No, 12591217 Jlagil ¢
ictivitiy Lia lg) il il
wners Lasll bl day
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01/11/2022, 13:00 my email - Etisalat Internet Mail

> On Nov 8, 2015, at 15:29, deborah.whitehead@gloss.global wrote:

5

> Hi Sarah

>

> Thank you for your prompt reply

>

> The 250,000dhs and Andrews 500,000dhs plus 5% interest will be paid back monthly as a priority as soon
as we are open

> Next the 750,000dhs loan Andrew put in will be paid back

> Then the 2 loans of 600,000dhs will be paid back

>

> All the above are priority payments ,in that order ,to get the business in a position to pay dividends to each
shareholder

>

> Regarding Bahrain.. As you are a shareholder in the main Gloss set up in Dubai , all negotiations for the
Bahrain franchise model will be held between all 4 board members.

> You will have all the support and commitment to open Bahrain as per the franchise agreement.To get
Bahrain operational will be the next step but we can not do this until Dubai location is open

>

> As we are moving fast with this in order to get open by 22nd I need to know if you are willing to inject the
250,000dhs by next week, or I will move forward with the new investor.

> Can you give me a yes or no answer now and I will go back to Andrew and arrange his final cash injection.

>
> Would you like to speak with Andrew first this evening?
>

> Kind regards

> Deborah

>

> From: "Sarah" <sarah(@]atifasalon.com>

> Sent: Sunday, November 8, 2015 11:13am

> To: deborah.whitehead@gloss.global

> Subject: Re: Gloss investor

>

> Dear Deborah

>

> If [ were able to cover the 250k dhs I would need some clarity into the following points:
>

> - Specify which month I can expect to be paid back the loan of 250k + 5% as I need this as carly as
possible.

> - Specify which month(s) I can expect to be paid back the loan of 600k.

> - Renegotiate Bahrain branch i.e. specify the percentage taken by gloss from the branch
> - Level of commitment and services provided from gloss to the Bahrain branch

>

hitps://docm2.eim.aefiwc_static/c11n/allDomain/layout/main.html?lang=en-US5&3.0.1.0.0_15051245&
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09/04/2022, 13:16 7~ ) Gmail - Fw: Payments due as at 08-07-15.xIsx

(W
M Gfﬁa" \ Tracey Dalton <traceyshopz@gmail.com=

Fw: Payments due as at 08-07-15.xlsx
1 message

andrew NMckeown <andymck@eim.ae>
To: Tracey Dalton Mckeown <traceyshopz@gmail.com=>

Wed, Jul 8, 2015 at 6:40 PM

------- Original Messagg-------

From: Mandie Poulter

Date: 08/07/2015 18:00:49

To: andymck@eim.ae

Cc- deborah.whitehead@gloss.global
Subject: Payments due as at 08-07-15.xlsx

Hi Andrew,

| have attached a schedule of the payments that are due for the build over the next two weeks.
Do you want to pay thern individually or one cheque to Salon Educators and we will make the

payments? Either works for us.

Kind Regards

Mandie Poulter

Financial Director @ Gloss

M. +971 52 919 3419 E. mandie.poulter@gloss.global vy http:/gloss.global

Villa 869 Al Wasl Road, Al Safa 2, Jumeirah, Dubai, UAE

To ensure you don't miss future emails, please add no-rephH@gless-global to your email address book or
safe senders list.

To join us on FACEBOOK or follow us on TWITTER just click the following links:

hﬁps:llmail.google.com!mail!ul()l?ik=42:aﬁ?14e5&view=pt&search=all&permthidﬁthread-f%am 506139364155763864&simpl=msg-{%3A1506139...  1/2




09/04/2022, 13:16 Gmail - Fw: Payments due as at 08-07-15.xIsx
http://facebook.com/glossglobal

http://twitter.com/gloss_global

This ¢-mail is intended for the named addressee(s) only. The content should be treated as confidential and the recipient may not disclose
this message or any attachment without authorisation. Attached files may contain designs and materials the copyrights of which are cwned

by Gloss. Unauthaorised use, copying or disclosure may be unlawful.

@j Payments due as at 08-07-15.xlsx
9K

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=42aff7 14e5&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A15061 39364155763864&simpl=msg-{%3A1506139... 2/2







Hi yes that's fine. | will be out
at a meeting from 11 til about
2pm. If | are before then just

call and | will send rose down.

Thanku & 8:21 PM

11 Jul 2015

Hello Deborah - I will give
Tracey a cheque to bring with
her tomorrow - | will make it
out to Salon Educators but
what is the full title? Thank
you Andrew 9:37 PM &/

Hi. It is Salon Educators JLT.
Thank you | will arrange a

receipt. A B

Thank you - also what time 7
& will you be there tomorrow as &

- Tracey says she will get the (©)
i early to get parked !!! _
9:39 PM v

% e ® 9




3:35 Wil LTE@ )

£ Back Contact Info Edit

Deborah Hair
+97150 728 1795

A [d Q

audio video search

@ Media, Links, and... None °

Starred Messages  None |

o2 Mute No
Wallpaper & Sound

Save to Camera Roll Default

Disappearing Messages Off

Encryption

B Messages and calls are end-to-
end er e ————— |\,




01/11/2022, 15:48 htips://dcm2.eim.aefiwc_static/layout/shell.html?lang=en-US&none

Date: 01/11/22 03:44 PM

Subject: Fwd: Fw: Re: Fw: Testimonial
From: Tracey Dalton <traceyshopz@gmail.com>

To: Andrew Mckeown <andymck@eim.ae>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Andrew Mckeown <andymck@eim.ae>

Date: Tue, May 12, 2015 at 8:17 PM

Subject: Fw: Re: Fw: Testimonial

To: Tracey Dalton Mckeown <traceyshopz @gmail.com>

From: Deborah Whitehead
Date: 12/05/2015 20;15:15
To: Andrew Mckeown
Subject: Re: Fw: Testimonial

Great. Thank you.
On Tue, May 12, 2015 10:02 am, Andrew Mckeown wrote:

> From: Andrew Mckeown

> Date: 12/05/2015 17:16:20
> To: Tracey Dalton Mckeown
> Subject: Testimonial

>

>

>

Deborah Whitehead
Director of Education
Salon Educators JLT
Tiffany Tower

office 1904

Jumeirah Lake Towers
Dubai

mobile 00971-50-7281795

hitps://decm?2.eim.aeliwc_static/layout/shell.htmi?lang=en-US&none




